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Discovering the Crème de la Crème : THE BEST RESTAURANTS UNVEILED    JUNE 2023 

  

The Official 2023 Haute Grandeur Global Restaurant Awards recognizes the top-rated 
restaurants from around the world that offer exceptional customer service, high standards 
and unparalleled guest experiences. 

  

Award-winning establishments are perceived as the benchmark in the industry and Haute 
Grandeur Global Restaurant Awards only award the most remarkable, of already exceptional 
restaurants. This year the standout comments submitted by first-hand customer experiences 
included quality of food, ambience and atmosphere, service, creativity, location and value. 
Award-winning restaurants have gone above and beyond to create unforgettable experiences 
to their guests from the smallest details to the grandest gestures. 

  

“These Awards trigger greater success in already remarkable industry, the winners set a new 
standard of excellence,” says Founder and President, Marinique de Wet. “The Haute 
Grandeur Global Restaurant Awards is more than just a celebration of our dignitaries’ 
achievements. It honors the principles of hard work, commitment, determination, leadership 
and success. continues de Wet. "Their outstanding commitment to excellence set these 
award-winning restaurants apart from their competitors when looking for the best dining 
experiences. " 

2023 Restaurant Winners include amongst others Novikov Istanbul from Turkey won the 
Global Title for Best Restaurant View, Best Gourmet Restaurant went to La Musa Restaurant 
& Rooftop Terrace at ARIA Retreat & SPA, Italy. The Excellence Award for Best Luxury Family 
Restaurant was scooped by El Mirador from Spain. This year’s category winners can be 
viewed at www.hautegrandeur.com/restaurants/winners 

  

More than ever before, recognition helps teams to remain positive and goal driven and we 
are truly proud to announce the winners of the annual Haute Grandeur Global Restaurant 
Awards. 

  

We invite you to explore the world’s top rated restaurants rated for by guests and to discover 
your next ultimate dining experience. 
  
To become a member or for more information, please visit www.hautegrandeur.com. 
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Note to Award-Winning Restaurants: 
  
Winner results should only be shared once a call has been scheduled with Haute Grandeur 
Global Excellence Awards and an announcement date was established. The official result 
announcement date planned should be in-sync with the date Haute Grandeur Global Awards 
announce the result of your estalishment to optimise the impact of the news. 
  
Note to Editor: 
  
About Haute Grandeur Global Awards 
  
In the world of Award initiatives Haute Grandeur Global Awards is unmatched.  
 
Excellence is recognized throughfeedback from guests and not quantity of votes by the  
general public or a panel of judges. This fair and transparent process guarantees unbiased  
result, a concept exclusive to the brand. 
The Haute Grandeur Global Awards honor establishments that continuously excel through  
remarkable hospitality experiences. The Awards recognize exceptional contributions by  
hotels, lodges, villas, resorts, retreats, spas and restaurants worldwide. 
 

Association with Haute Grandeur Global Awards guarantees participating establishments 
global recognitiondistinction, credibility and influence. The Awards are revered as the highest 
accolade in hospitality – a promise of unparalleled service excellence.  

 

For more information on who won in the 2023 Awards season visit www.hautegrandeur.com 

 

Media enquiries: 

Email info@hautegrandeur.com 

  
  
  

 

 


